Proposed 2012 North Carolina Amendments to the 2009 International Residential Code

(Changes only listed-all other 2009 IRC base code to remain)

Residential Ad Hoc Committee Acknowledgements

David W. Conner, Sr, PE
NC Department of Insurance
1202 Mail Service Center
Raleigh, NC 27699-1202

Jeff Griffin

Mecklenburg County Government
700 North Tryon Street

Charlotte, NC 28202

Steve L. Knight, PE
Structural Engineer
1507 Mt. Vernon Ave
Statesville, NC 28677

Jim Lane

City of Raleigh Inspections Department

P.O. Box 590
Raleigh, NC 27602

Mike Page

NC Department of Insurance
1202 Mail Service Center
Raleigh, NC 27699-1202

Robert Privott

NC Home Builders Association
P.O. Box 99090

Raleigh, NC 27624

Leon Skinner

City of Raleigh Inspections Department
P.O. Box 590

Raleigh, NC 27602

David Smith, Committee Chair
D. Smith, Builder

905 Saltwood Lane
Wilmington, NC 28411

Dan Tingen, President

Tingen Construction Company, Inc.
8411-101 Garvey Drive

Raleigh, NC 27616

Hawley Truax

Z. Smith Reynolds Foundation
147 South Cherry St., #200
Winston-Salem, NC 27101-5287

Thomas P. Turner, FAIA Architect
ADEP, PA

3225 Wickersham Road
Charlotte, NC 28211

Hiram Williams

Action Construction Company
P.O. Box 4270, 51 J.H. Batts Road
Surf City, NC 28445

Add on page ix-Chapter 45 High Wind Zones. This chapter applies to buildings
constructed in NC high wind zones. These provisions shall be in addition to or in lieu of
the requirements of Chapters 1-8.

Add on page ix- Chapter 46 Coastal and Flood Plains Standards. The requirements of
this Chapter apply to all construction located within areas identified by governmental
agency (state and federal) as coastal high hazard area, ocean hazard areas, the
regulatory flood plain areas, and all areas designated as 130mph (57 m/s) wind zone.

Add on page xx- Chapter 45 High Wind Zones.
Add on page xx- Chapter 46 Coastal and Flood Plains Standards.
Delete Xiii Sample ordinance page



Chapter 1 Administration

Section

Change

R101.1 Title

These provisions shall be known as the North Carolina Residential Code for One- and Two-Family

Dwellings eHNAME-OFJURISBICHON]; and shall be cited as such and will be referred to herein as is
this code.

R101.2 Scope

The provisions of the Haternational North Carolina Residential Code for One- and Two-Family Dwellings
shall apply to the construction, alteration, movement, enlargement, replacement, repair, equipment, use
and occupancy, location, removal and demolition of detached one- and two-family dwellings and
multiple single-family dwellings (townhouses) not more than three stories above grade in height with a
separate means of egress and their accessory buildings and structures.

Exception: Live/work units complying with the requirements of Section 419 of the
NC Building Codeshal be permitted to be built as orend twoefamily dwellingsor
TownhousesFire suppression required by Section 419.5 ofN@duilding Codevhen
constructed under tHe¢C Residential Cod®r One and Two-family

Dwellings shall conform to Section 903L3 of the International Building Code.

Accessory buildings with any dimension greater than 12 feet must meet the provisions of this code.
Accessory buildings may be constructed without a masonry or concrete foundation, except in coastal
high hazard or ocean hazard areas, provided all of the following conditions are met:

The building shall not exceed 400 sq. ft. or one story in height:

The building is supported on a wood foundation of a minimum 2x6 or 3x4 mud sill of approved
wood in accordance with Section 323: and

3. The building is anchored to resist overturning and sliding by installing a minimum of one ground
anchor at each corner of the building. The total resisting force of the anchors shall be equal to
20 psf times the plan area of the building.

Accessory structures are not required to meet the provisions of this code, except decks; gazebos;
and retaining walls as required by Section R404.1.3. For swimming pools and spas, see Appendix
G.

The purpose of this code is taadish minimum requirements to safeguard the public safety, healtyes@tal

R101.3 - b . e .

Purpose welfare through affordability, structural strength, means of egress facilities, stability, sanitation, li
and ventilation, energy conservation and safety to life and pyofpert fire and other hazards attribut
to the built environment.

R102.5 Provisions in the appendices shall apply unless specifically referenced in Hebpting-erdinance€Code

Appendices text.

R102.7 For requirements of existing structures, refer to the North Carolina Administration and Enforcement

Existing Requirements Code. Fhelegal-oceupancy-of any-structure-existing-on-the-date-of-adeption-of-thi

Structures FADE-PEHRIIEE0

R103.1-R103.3

Delete and replace with:

Information concerning the creation and operation of inspections departments may be found in the
North Carolina Administrative Code and Policies.

R104.1-
R104.11.1

Delete and replace with:

Information concerning the duties and powers of the building official may be found in the North
Carolina Administrative Code and Policies.




R105.1-R105.9

Delete and replace with:
Information concerning permits may be found in the North Carolina Administrative Code and Policies.

R106.1-R106.5

Delete and replace with:

Information concerning construction documents may be found in the North Carolina Administrative
Code and Policies.

Section R107

Section R108

Section R109
Section R110
Section R111
Section R112
Section R113
Section R114

Delete all sections noted with no replacement language

Chapter 2 Definitions

R201.3 Terms
defined in
other codes

Where terms are not defined in this code such terms shall have meanings ascribed to them as in other
code publications of the North Carolina Code Council.

Definitions

ACCESSORY BUILDINGS. . In one and two family dwellings not more than three stories high with
separate means of egress, a building, the use of which is incidental to that of the main building and
which is detached and located on the same lot.

ACCESSORY STRUCTURE. Accessory structure is any structure not roofed over and enclosed that is
not considered an accessory building located on one and two family dwelling sites which is incidental to
that of the main building. Examples of accessory structures are but not limited to; fencing, decks,
gazebos, arbors, retaining walls, barbecue pits, detached chimneys, tree houses, playground
equipment, vard art, etc. Accessory structures are not required to meet the provisions of this code,
except decks; gazebos; and retaining walls as required by Section R404.1.3.

In one- and two-family dwellings not more than three stories high with separate means of egress, a
building, the use of which is incidental to that of the main building and which is located on the same lot.

ACCESSIBLE. Signifies access that requires the removal of an access panel or similar
removable obstruction. For energy purposes, ACCESSIBLE means admitting close approach
as a result of not being guarded by locked doors, elevation or other effective means (see

A R eily dccessibled ) .

ACH50. Air Changes per Hour of measured air flow in relation to the building volume while the
building is maintained at a pressure difference of 50 Pascals.

ADDITION. An extension or increase in floor area or height of a building or structure._For
energy purposes, an extension or increase in the conditioned space floor area or height of a
building or structure.

AIR BARRIER MATERIAL. Material(s) that have an air permeability not to exceed 0.004
cfm/ft2 under a pressure differential of 0.3 in. water (1.57psf) (0.02 L/s.m2 @ 75 Pa) when
tested in accordance with ASTM E 2178.

AIR BARRIER SYSTEM. Material(s) assembled and joined together to provide a barrier to air
leakage through the building envelope. An air barrier is a combination of air barrier materials
and sealants.

APPROVED. Acceptable to the building official.
ATTIC, HABITABLE. A finishederunfinishedattic area meeting the definition of
Habitable Space ambtconsidered-story, complying with all of the following




requirements:
1. The occupiable floor area is at least 70 square feet (17m2), in accordance

with Section R304,
2. The occupiable floor area has a ceiling height in accordance with Section

R305, and

3. The occupiable space is enclosed by the roof assemblg,dbowe walls

(if applicable) on the sides and the flammiling assembly below.
BALCONY, EXTERIOR. An exterior floor projecting from and supported by a structure

without additional in dependent supports

BASEMENT WALL. The opaque potion of a wall that encloses one side of a basement and
has an average below grade wall area that is 50% or more of the total opaque and non-opaque
area of that enclosing side. For energy purposes, a wall 50 percent or more below grade and
enclosing conditioned space.

BEDROOM. Sleeping room.

BPI ENVELOPE PROFESSIONAL. An individual that has successfully passed the Building
Performance Institute written and field examination requirements for the Building Envelope
certification.

BUILDING THERMAL ENVELOPE. The basement walls, exterior walls, floor, roof, and any
other building element that enclose conditioned space. This boundary also includes the
boundary between conditioned space and any exempt or unconditioned space.

CEM25. Cubic Feet per Minute of measured air flow while the building is maintained at a
pressure difference of 25 P a s ¢ €0I1 thghes w.p.)

CEM50. Cubic Feet per Minute of measured air flow while the building is maintained at a
pressure difference of 50 P a s ¢ d0d.26nshes w.p.).

CLOSED CRAWL SPACE. A foundation without wall vents that uses air sealed walls, ground and
foundation moisture control, and mechanical drying potential to control crawl space moisture. Insulation
may be located at the floor level or at the exterior walls.

CODE OFFICIAL. The officer or other designated authority charged with the administration
and enforcement of this code, or a duly authorized representative.

CONDITIONED CRAWL SPACE. A conditioned crawl space is a foundation without wall vents that
encloses an intentionally heated and/or cooled space. Insulation is located at the exterior walls.

CONDITIONED SPACE. An area or room within a building being heated or cooled, containing
uninsulated ducts, or with a fixed opening directly into an adjacent conditioned space.
DAMPPROOFING. A coating or the application of coatings applied to retard the penetration of water
vapor and moisture through or into walls or into interior spaces.

DECK. An exterior floor system supported on at least two opposing sides by an adjoining structu
and/or osts, piers, or other in dependent supports.

EMERGENCY ESCAPE AND RESCUE OPENING. An operable exterior window, door or simil
device that providefor a means of escape and access for rescue in the evergroéeagency.

EXTERIOR WALL. An abovegrade wallthat defines the exterior boundaries of a building. Incly
betweerfloor spandrels, peripheral edges of floors, roof and basementwalklse dormer walls, gabl
end walls, walls enclosing a nmsard roof and basement walls with an average bgtade vall area that
is less than 50 percent of the total opaque and nonopaque area of that enclosing side.
F-FACTOR. The perimeter heat loss factor for slab-on-grade floors (Btu/h x ft x °F) [W/(m x

K)].

FAMILY. Family is an individual, two or more persons related by blood, marriage or law, or a group of
not more than any five persons living together in a dwelling unit. Servants having common
housekeeping facilities with a family consisting of an individual, or more persons related by blood,
marriage or law, are a part of the family for this code.




[B] FIREPLACE. An assembly consisting of a hearth and fire chamber and smoke chamber, beginning
at the hearth and ending at the top of the smoke chamber, of noncombustible material and provided
with a chimney, for use with solid fuels.

Factory-built fireplace. A listed and labeled fireplace and chimney system composed of factory-
made components, and assembled in the field in accordance with manufacturer's instructions and
the conditions of the listing.

Masonry chimney. A field-constructed chimney composed of solid masonry units, bricks, stones or
concrete, beginning at the top of the smoke chamber and the flue termination.

Masonry fireplace. A field-constructed fireplace composed of solid masonry units, bricks, stones or
concrete, beginning at the hearth and ending at the top of the smoke chamber.

Smoke chamber. That part of a masonry fireplace which extends from the top of the firebox to the
start of the chimney flue lining. A smoke chamber shall have a damper and a smoke shelf.

FIRE SEPARATION DISTANCE. The distance measured from the building face to one of
following:

1. To the closest interior lot line; or

2. To the centerline of a street, an alley or public way; or
3. To an imaginary line between two buildings on the lot.
The distance shall be measured at a right angle from the ftee wéll.

FOAM BACKER BOARD. Foam plastic used in siding amtions where the foam plastic is
component of the siding.

FOAM PLASTIC INSULATION. A plastic that is intentically expandedy the use of a foaming age
to produce areduceddensity plastic containing voids consisting of open or closed cells distri
throughout the plastic for thermal idating or acoustic purposes and that has a density less th
pounds per cubic fod820 kg/nf) unless it is used as interior trim.

FOAM PLASTIC INTERIOR TRIM. Exposed foam plastiosed as picture molds, chair rails, cro
moldings, baseboardsandrails, ceiling beams, door trim and window trim and lamdecorative o
protective matéals used in fixed applications.

FULLY ENCLOSED ATTIC FLOOR SYSTEMI The ceiling insulation is enclosed on all six
sides by an air barrier system, such as taped drywall below, solid framing joists on the sides,
solid blocking on the ends, and solid sheathing on top which totally enclose the insulation. This
system provides for full depth insulation over the exterior walls.

HAZARDOUS LOCATION, GLAZING. See Section R308.4.

HEAT TRAP. An arrangement of piping and fittings, such as elbows, or a commercially
available heat trap that prevents thermosyphoning of hot water during standby periods.
HEATED SLAB. Slab-on-grade construction in which the heating elements, hydronic tubing, or
hot air distribution system is in contact with, or placed within or under, the slab.

HEAT TRAP. An arrangement of piping and fittings, such as elbows, or a commercially
available heat trap that prevents thermosyphoning of hot water during standby periods.
HEATED SLAB. Slab-on-grade construction in which the heating elements, hydronic tubing, or
hot air distribution system is in contact with, or placed within or under, the slab.

HERS RATER. An individual that has completed training and been certified by RESNET
(Residential Energy Services Network) Accredited Rating Provider.

HUMIDISTAT. A requlatory device, actuated by changes in humidity, used for automatic

control of relative humidity.

HURRICANE -PRONE REGIONS. Areas vulnerable to hurricanes, defined as the U.S. Atlantic G
and Gulf of Mexico coasts where the basic wind speed isegrdetn90 or equal to 110niles per hout
(145 km/h), and Hawaii, Puerto Rico, Guam, Virgin Islands, and America Samoa.
INFILTRATION. The uncontrolled inward air leakage into a building caused by the pressure
effects of wind or the effect of differences in the indoor and outdoor air density or both.




LABELED. Appliances, Equipment, materials or products to which have been affixed a label,
seal, symbol or other identifying mark of a nationally recognized testing laboratory, inspection
agency, or other organization as approved by the NC Building Code Council concerned with
product evaluation that maintains periodic inspection of the production of the above-labeled
items and whose labeling indicates either that the appliance, equipment, material or product
meets identified standards or has been tested and found suitable for a specified purpose.
MASONRY CHIMNEY. Deleted.

[B] MASONRY UNIT. Brick, tile, stone, glass block or concrete block conforming to the requirements
specified in Section 2103 of the North Carolina Building Code.

Clay. A building unit larger in size than a brick, composed of burned clay, shale, fire clay or mixtures
thereof.

Concrete. A building unit or block larger in size than 12 inches by 4 inches by 4 inches (305 mm by
102 mm by 102 mm) made of cement and suitable aggregates.

Glass. Nonload-bearing masonry composed of glass units bonded by mortar.

Hollow. A masonry unit whose net cross-sectional area in any plane parallel to the loadbearing
surface is less than 75 percent of its gross cross-sectional area measured in the same plane.

Solid. A masonry unit whose net cross-sectional area in every plane parallel to the loadbearing
surface is 75 percent or more of its cross-sectional area measured in the same plane.

PLANS. Construction documents.
[B] POSITIVE ROOF DRAINAGE. Deleted.

R-VALUE (THERMAL RESISTANCE). The inverse of the time rate of heat flow through a
body from one of its bounding surfaces to the other surface for a unit temperature difference
between the two surfaces, under steady state conditions, per unit area (h x ft> x °F/Btu) [(m? x
K)/W].

[B] REGISTERED DESIGN PROFESSIONAL. See the NC Administration and Enforcement
Requirements Code for definition.

SCREW LAMP HOLDERS. A lamp base that requires a screw-in-type lamp, such as a
compact-fluorescent, incandescent, or tungsten-halogen bulb.

SEMI-CONDITIONED SPACE A space indirectly conditioned within the thermal envelope
that is not directly heated or cooled. For energy purposes, semi-conditioned spaces are
treated as conditioned spaces

SERVICE WATER HEATING. Supply of hot water for purposes other than comfort heating.
SLEEPING ROOM. A room designated as sleeping or bedroom on the plans.

SOLAR HEAT GAIN COEFFICIENT (SHGC). The ratio of the solar heat gain entering the
space through the fenestration assembly to the incident solar radiation. Solar heat gain
includes directly transmitted solar heat and absorbed solar radiation which is then reradiated,
conducted or convected into the space. This value is related to the Shading Coefficient (SC)
by the formula SHGC =0.87 * SC.

[B] STORY. That portion of a building included between the upper surface of a floor and the upper
surface of the floor or roof next above. A flood resistant enclosure, designed to break away so as not to
cause collapse, shall not be considered as a story when determining height.

STORY, ATTIC. Any story situated wholly or partly in the roof, so designated, arranged or built as to be
used for storage or habitation. If an attic which is accessible by a fixed stairway has a 7 ft. clear height
for greater than 50% of the floor area of the story below, then the space shall be considered as a story.

STRUCTURE. Deleted.

SUNROOM ADDITION . A onestory structureattachedaddedto an existingdwelling with a glazing
areainexces of 40 percent of the gross area of t
TOWNHOUSE. A single-family dwelling unit constructed in a row of attached units separated by
property lines and with open space on at least two sides.




WALL, ABOVE-GRADE A wall more than 50 percent above grade and enclosing conditioned
space. This includes between-floor spandrels, peripheral edges of floors, roof and basement
knee walls, dormer walls, gable end walls, walls enclosing a mansard roof and skylight shafts.
WALL, CRAWLSPACE. The opaque portion of a wall that encloses a crawl space and is
partially or totally below grade.

WALL VENTED CRAWL SPACE. A foundation that uses foundation wall vents as a primary means to
control space moisture. Insulation is located at the floor level.

WATERPROOFING. A coating or the application of coatings applied to prevent the penetration of water
through or into walls or into interior spaces.

WINDOW. See Fenestration

WIND BORNE DEBRIS REGION. Areas within hurricane prone regions defined as that area east of the
Intracoastal waterway from the NC/SC state line north to Beaufort Inlet and from that point to include
the barrier islands to the NC/VA state line.

ZONE. A space or group of spaces within a building with heating or cooling requirements that
are sufficiently similar so that desired conditions can be maintained throughout using a single
controlling device.

Chapter 3 Building Planning

R301.2.1 Wind
limitations

Buildings and portions theredghall be limited by wind speed, as defined Tiable R301.2(1) an
construction methods in accordance with this code. Beisid speeds shall be determined from Fig
R301.2(4) Where different construction methods and structural nadgeare used for various portions O
building, the applicableequirements of this section for each portion shall apMigere loads forval
coveringscurtain walls roof-coveringsexterior windows, skylights, garage doors and exterior do@rsot
otherwise specified, the loads listed in Tali801.2(2) adjustedor height and exposure usir
Table R301.2(3) shall be used to determine design load penfiee requirements fevall-coverings
curtaln walls Feef—eevenngs exterlor wmdows skyllghts garage doors anderior doors Asphailt

R301.2.1.1
Design
criteria

Constructlon in reglonwhere the basic wmd speeds from Figure R301 2(4) equeiceed110miles per
hour @9 m/s)shall bedesigned in accordance with one of the folly:

1. American Forest and Paper Association (AF&PA) Wood Frame Construction Manual for
One- and Two-Family Dwellings (WFCM).

2. International Code Council (ICC) Standard for residential Construction in High Wind
Regions (ICC-600).

3. Minimum Design Loads for Buildings and Other Structures (ASCE-7).

4. American Iron and Steel Institute (AISI), Starttifor ColdFormed Steel Framing
Prescriptive
Method for Oneand Twafamily Dwellings (COFS/PM) with Supplement to Standi$or
Cold Formed Steel FramirfgPrescriptive Method For One and TwoeFamily
Dwellings
(AIS1 S230).
5. Concrete construction shall be designed in accordance with the provisions of this code.

6. Structural insulated panel (SIP) walls shall be designed in accordance with the provisions
of this code.

7. High wind chapters 45 and 46




Table R301.2
(1)

Climatic and Geographic Design Criteria

Subject to Damage From Ice
Barrier

Wind Seismic Frost Winter Under- Air Mean
Roof | Speed Design Line Design | Layment Flood Freezing | Annual
Load (mph) Category | Weathering® | Depth | Termite® -Decay Temp | Required | Hazardb Index Temp

Figure Moderate
20 301.2(4) | 301.2(2) Moderate 12 0| -Heavy | Mederate Local Local Local Local Local

For SI: 1 pound per square foot = 0.0479 kN/m.?, 1 mile per hour = 1.609 km/h.

a. Weathering may require a higher strength concrete or grade of masonry than necessary to
satisfy the structural requirements of this code. The grade of masonry units shall be
determined from ASTM C 34, C55,C 62, C 73, C 90, C 129, C 145, C 216 or C 652.

b. The Jurisdiction shall fil!/l in this part of
the National Flood Insurance Program (date of adoptions of the first code or ordinance for
management of flood hazard areas), (b) the date(s) of the currently effective FIRM and FBFM,
or other flood hazard map adopted by the community, as may be amended.

C. Protection is required in all of NC per section R318.

Figure
R301.2(2)

Delete Figure R301.2 (2) on pages 27, 28, 29, 30, 31 and add NC
Figure R301.2(2)ir emove word Acontinuedo




Q SSYTD ALIS - STINODALYD NOISHU DINSIES
SLNIWANIWY YNITO¥VD HIMON - 02 TVIINTQISTE TYNOLLYNYLLNI
panunuod - (2)7'10¢¥ UNOI

“apoa spy go suaanban sjuinas ag) woup Wiaaxs e ;) Lodamy ubfEog wsig up paveaog SBupamp djuit o) pur =au0 paER( ot

T 08 UNRG Glj ANIETU00TE U 7 SAGHAED LHISA() J[UIKIIS ) PAINISU0D eIpUag o0 Aidd (IRgH 3p0D SEQD I0 AunKLGId ISR ML ']
TUROIKD GHON 30 PAFNIDE $7 AN [RAUMHADY [FRONRGIAIB] S) BF PORBIVEY - (251054 BUADIA VD DASTG § TIEp ONDHISY

W FPOE ~ W) [ IS Mo

q AJODdLYD
NOISA JINSTES

J AYODELYD
NOISIC JINSTES

Ny
e

T _iweaﬂmg
Ty ’ PN

iy apy oot
'

Sungogy

Pz

¥ AHODALYD
NOISAQ DINSIES

(Need to make division lines darker)




COUNTIES IN SEISMIC DESIGN CATEGORY C

Alleghany
Alexander
Anson
Ashe
Avery
Bladen
Brunswick
Buncombe
Brunswick
Burke
Caldwell
Catawba
Cherokee
Cleveland
Columbus
Gaston
Graham
Haywood
Henderson
Hoke
[redell
Jackson
Lincoln
Macon
Madison
McDowell
Mecklenburg
Mitchell
Polk
Richmond
Robeson
Rutherford
Scotland
Surry
Swain
Transylvania
Union
Watauga
Wilkes
Yancey

FIGURE R301.2(2)-continued

Figure R301.2
3

Delete Figure R301.2 (3)

Figure R301.2

(4)

Delete figure (pages 33,34,35,36,37)




Table
301.2 (4)

Design Pressures For Doors and Windows a,b,c,d

Positive and Negative In PSF

Mean Roof Height (ft)
Velocity (mph) 15 25 35
90 15 17 19
100 20 23 25

For SI: 1 foot = 304.8, 1 mile per hour = 0.44 m/s.

a. Alternate design pressures may be determined by using North Carolina State Building Code
i General Construction, ASCE-7, or the 2009 International Building Code.

b. If window or door is more than 4 ft. from a corner, the pressure from this table shall be
permitted to be multiplied by 0.87. This adjustment does not apply to garage doors.

c. For windows and doors in structures with a roof slope of 10 degrees or less (2:12) from the
table may be multiplied by 0.90.

d. Design pressure ratings based on standards listed in Section 613 are adequate
documentation of capacity to resist pressures from the table.

Figure R301.2

Delete Figure R301.2(5) pg 38, 39

5)

R301.2.1.5 Delete
R301.2.1.5.1

Table Delete
R301.2.1.5.1

Figure Delete
R301.2.1.5(1)
R301.2.1.5 Delete
R301.2.1.5.1 Delete
Table Delete
R301.2.1.5.1

Figure Delete
R301.2.1.5.1

1

Figure Delete
R301.2.1.5.1

(2)

R301.2.1.5.1 Delete
3

R301.2.2.1.1 Delete
Table Delete
R301.2.2.1.1
R301.2.1.1.2 Delete




R301.2.2.2
Seismic
Design
Category C

R301.2.2.2 Seisi Design Category CTownhousestructures assigned to Seismic Design Categor
shall conform to the requirements of this section.

R301.2.2.2.4

Concrete
Construction

aeeerdaneewrthﬁAGJ%j‘LSI' ownhouses Wlth above grade exterlor concrete Walls shaII comply with
requirements of PCA 100 or shall be designeaiceordance with ACI 318.

R301.2.2.3

R301.2.2.3.1
R301.2.2.3.2
R301.2.2.3.3
R301.2.2.3.4
R301.2.2.3.5
R301.2.2.3.6
R301.2.2.3.7
R301.2.2.4

Delete

R301.2.4
Floodplain
construction

Buildings and structures constructed in flood hazard areas (including A or V Zones) as established in
Table R301.2(1) shall be designed and constructed in accordance with Section R323.
Exception: Buildings in floodways that are designated on the Flood Insurance Rate Maps
(FIRM) or the Flood Boundary and Floodway Maps (FBEM) that are provided by the National
Flood Insurance Program shall not be approved under this section; the provisions of the ASCE

24 shall apply.

Figure R301.2
(4)

Delete Figure R301.2 (4) pages 33,34,35,36,37 and replace with
following NC Figure R301.2(4)ir emove word Acontin
figure. Change spelling on NC Coun
County listing, also remove from footnote #4 the word Island behind
Topsail.




TVAYELLNI dADNTYENDTY NVEIW UVIA-0¢ YOI SAFAIS ANIA DISVd
SLNAWJONIWY VNITOUVD HLION - ZJ0D TVLLNIJISAY TVNOLLVNIA,LNI
PanuURuUOd - (F)T' 10U HUNOId

K CRIBGTHRICEY DR, (SIS0 J0) pauiuees 9o (xS duoilay puisa (eads pUE Auoquoniaid Beano ‘eET0R Uil BRI
g Armgiyyy pun “UEpOIED GUON J03 PoT|TE S0 DR (NERIapIRal TERORBLISNSE A1t U] RMOpEnD - (0 DORAL WHOIDL] wodn [ovE & e paads puis G
&6 Mooy gy o AsuBmma 3 axwsmdr so) apedt awoqe @ §¢ 18 100y d sPipe o) spexly prw sof puoses-f uijuep TR paE xan(na CE
15T Q] 01 BPADIED n d

. LML "1 e InEM] aaal aqEe [ OUDS gRE - 100 T S5 JU
A1ST02 D)Wk EOION LTAME Jo 3sam ydu gz7 Ay GoR°T { g | W FE T SIS g
SAPUNOY) IFACUBH

"DpE INON §70 Jo | MIN PUE Ydlmsunig ejoN ﬂ

IWED DY) Y HPRRD
AU AN OF1L ., Oy #

Aunom opAM sapeN " o |-”m_ Auno) jo aduereq — ydw g1y
FUFIVL Ve PTvg i - dyysumoy = yyesdo-ydus o
N gy P .
JERURD BaTR] ! MOI Jo Isea-ydw ggg
[ 1o e .nz: . - o1l Luno) spusd ALON

0¢T 4 -~ s o
[ - I

\ AT [reteT H_ ﬁ
., =<
! S Lt W — | gL AR
4 Lz -l i iy
h «m.__m.m_...‘. Laang)
r__._ . gl P N . Fa
. o . — ey
@ Y ool — A T s ﬁt]!a )
CA% - UL e ,
_ } . L m \ | uRIey pulA [E1eds
T o e s
wesioy) | Lussluega IRy, ...IE
| |
ozr| [orr]  [oo1] L 06

DNINNY1E DN




BASIC DESIGN WIND SPEEDS

Counties ot listed 90
Anson 00 Les 100
Alleghany special mountain region Lenior 10
Ashe special moutain region | Madison special mountain region
Avery special mountain region Martin 110
__ Beaufor 110 Mitchell  special mountain region
Bertie 110 Moaore 100
Bladen 110 Nash 100
Brunswick 120130  New Hanover” 107130
Buncombe  special mouniain region Nottharnpton 100
Camden 110 Onslow 120130 east of [CW
Carteret 130 Pamlico” 1207130
Chawan 10 Pasquotank 10
Columbus 120 Pender? 1101200130
Craven 120 Perquimans 110
(Cumberland 100 | P 110
__ Cumituck 120 ! Richmond 100
[are 130 Robeson ne
Duplin 110 Sampson 110
__ Edgecombe 100 seotland 100
Franklin 100 Swain __ spetial mountain region
(rates 100 Tyrell 120
_ Graham _ special mountain region Wake 100
Greene 110 | Washington 10
Halifax 100 Watauga  special mountain region
Hamet 100 Wayne 110
Haywood  special mountain region Wilson 100
Hertford . 100 Yancey  special mountain region
Hoks 100
Hyded 120/130
Jackson special mountain region
___Johnston 100
Jones 120

FIGURE R301.2(4)-continued

d,

jﬂ/ﬂn
1. Brunswick County - 120 mph zone west of Hwy 17, 130 mph zone east of Hwy 17, /40 r"'PL1 en ‘E"zé/ f;/m

2. Hyde County - 120 mph zone west of US Route 246, 130 mph zone east of US ]?.Uute: 246.

3. New Hanover County - 120 mph zone west of Hwy 17, 130 mph zone east of Hwy 17.

4. Pender County - 130 mph zone east of the Intercoastal Waterway, 120 mph zone in the Township of Topsail Island, and the remainder of the County is
the 110 mph zane.

3. Pamilico County - 130 mph zone east of SR 55 and Hwy 304, 120 mph zone west of SR 55 and Hwy 304,




Figure R301.2
(4)

BASICD ND SP R |

Counties not listed 90
Anson 100 Lee 100
Alleghany special mountain region Lenior 110
Ashe special mountain region Madison special mountain region
Avery special mountain region Martin 110
Beaufort 110 Mitchell special mountain region
Bertie 110 Moore 100
Bladen 110 Nash 100
Brunswick' 120/130 New Hanover’ 120/130
Buncombe special mountain region Northampton 100
Camden 110 Onslow 1207130 east of ICW
Carteret 130 Pamlico’ 120/130
Chowan 110 Pasquotank 110
Columbus 12 Pender* 110/120/130
Craven 120 Perquimans 110
Cumberland 100 Pitt 110
Currituck 120 Richmond 100
Dare 130 Robeson 110
Duplin 110 Sampson 110
Edgecombe 100 Scotland 100

" Franklin 100 Swain special mountain region ;
Gates 100 Tyrell 120
Graham special mountain region Wake 100
Greene 110 Washington 110
Halifax 100 Watauga special mountain region
Harnett 100 Wayne 110
Haywood special mountain region Wilson 100
Hertford 100 Yancey special mountain region
Hoke 100
Hyde* 120/130
Jackson special mountain region
Johnston 100
Jones 120

1. Brunswick County - 120 mph zone west of Hwy 17, 130 mph zone east of Hwy 17, 140 mph on Bald Head Island.
2. Hyde County - 120 mph zone west of U.S. Route 264, 130 mph zone east of U.S. Route 264.
3. New Hanover County - 120 mph zone west of Hwy 17, 130 mph zone east of Hwy 17.

4. Pender County- 130 mph zone east of the [ntercoastal Waterway, 120 mph zone in the Township of Topsail, and the remainder of the County is the 1 10 mph zone.

5. Pamilico County - 130 mph zone east of SR 55 and Hwy 306, 120 mph zone west of SR 55 and Hwy 306.




Table 301.7

Table 301.7
Allowable Deflection of Structural Members ab.c,d.e

Change note under table to read:
Note: L= span length in inches, H= span height in inches.
f. When floor spans exceed 20 feet, joists, built-up beams and trusses shall not be spaced
greater than 24 inches and deflection shall not exceed L/480.

R302.1
Exterior walls

Construction, projections, openings and penetratioestefior wallsof dwellingsand accessory
buildings shall comply with Table R302.1.

Exceptions:

1. Walls, projections, openings or peaétrns in walls perpendicular to the line used to determine t
fire separation distanc& ownhouse projections shall comply with R302.2.5.

2. Walls ofdwellingsandaccessorpuildingslocated on the saniet.

3. Detached tool sheds and storage shedgh@leses and similar structures exempted from permits
notrequired to provide wall protection based on location onathérojections beyond trexterior wall
shallnot extend over thiet line.

4. Detached garages accessory diovallinglocated witlin 2 feet (610 mm) of kot line are permitted to
have roof eave projections not exceeding 4 inches (102 mm).

5. Foundation vents installed in compliance with this code are permitted.

R302.2.2
Parapets

Parapets constructed in accordance with Section R3&hall be constructed for townhouses as an
extension of exterior walls or common walls in accordance with the following:
1. Where roof surfaces adjacent to the wall or walls are at the same elevation, the parapet shall ¢
not
lessthan 30 iches (762 mm) above the roof surfaces.
2. Where roof surfaces adjacent to the wall or walls are at different elevations and the higher roo
morethan 30 inches (762 mm) above the lower roof, the parapet shall extend not less than 30 ing
(762
mm) above the lower roof surface.
Exception: A parapet is not required in the two cases above when the roof is covered with
minimumclass C roof covering, and the roof decking or sheathing is of noncombustible
materials
or approved fireretardantreated wod for a distance of 4 feet (1219 mm) on each side of th
wall or walls, or one layer of 5/ch (15.9 mm) Type X gypsum board is installed directly
beneath the roof decking or sheathing, supported by a minimum of norintd 51 mm)
ledgers attadkd to the sides of the roof framing members, for a minimum distance of 4 feet
(1220
mm) on each side of the wall or walldo openings or penetrations including dormers allowe
within this 46 protected area.

R302.2.5
Townhouse
eave
protection

In townhouse construction (with three or more attached dwellings) Projections extending into the
separation distance shall have not less than 1 hour fire resistive construction on the underside. S
material beyond the fire separation distance shall ti@rsky attached to framing members and shall
constructed using either noncombustible soffit materiakrétardantreated soffit material; vinyl soffit
installed over 34nch (19 mm) wood sheathing or S5f&h (16 mm) gypsum board; or aluminum soffit|
installed over %4nch (19 mm) wood sheathing or &f&h (16 mm) gypsum board. Venting
requirements shall be provided in both soffit and underlayments. Vents shall be either namihal?2
(51 mm) continuous or equivalent intermittent and shall not exteeshinimum net free air
requirements established in Section R806.2 by more than 50 percent.

Vents in soffit are not allowed within 4 feet (1219 mm) of fire walls or property lines.

R302.2.6
Townhouse
eave

Overhang projections not exceedir®jitiches shall be allowed to extend beyond the property line ir
townhouse buildings provided all the following conditions are met:
1. Required fire resistant rated wall assembly is tight to roof deck; and




projections

2. Eaves shall be protected with roof decking and fasicin-combustible materials or approved
fire-retardanttreated wood; and

3. Eaves shall have not less than 1 hourf@sistive construction on the underside.

R302.2.7
Flame Spread

Vinyl Siding and vinyl soffit materials when used in townhouse constiustiall have a Flame Spre
Index of 25 or less as tested in accordance with AST84.E

R302.2.8 See Appendix K.

Sound

Transmission

R305.1 Add exception under section R305.1 Ceiling Height

Ceiling Height | 3. Beams and girders spaced not less than 4 feet (1219mm) on center may project not more than 6
inches (152 mm) below the required ceiling height.

R308.1 R308.1 Identification. Except as indicated in Section R308. dath pane of glazing installed in hazard

Identification

locations as defineth Sect i on R308. 4 shall be prat@r Specidyidg wiid
applied the designation, designating tiyge of glass and the safety glazing standard with which it
plies, which is visible in the final installation. The designasioall be acid etched, sandblasted, cerar,
fired, laser etchedembossed, or be of a type which once applied cannot be rematedit being

destroyed.
Exceptions:
1.For other than temper patlonsgatead requirednaovided thebding.
official approves the use of a certificate, affidavit or othedewvie confirming compliance wit
this code.
2. Tempered spandrel glass is permitted to be identijethe manufacturer with a removable pa|
design#ion.
R308.4 R308.4 Hazardous locations.
Hazardous Remove fAarco from item #2
locations
R310.1.1 All emergency escape and rescue opengigdl have aminimum net clear openable area of 4 square
Minirﬁu.m feet (0 372 m2) The minimum net clear opening height shall bech2$ (558 mm). The minimum nef

opening area

clear opening width shall be 20 inches (508 mm). Emergency escape and rescue openings must
mini-mum total glazing area of not less than 5 square feet ({@2%5 the case of a ground flovel
window and not les$in 5.7 square feet (0.530 m2) in the case of an upper story window.

R311.1 Means

All dwellingsshall be provided with a means of egress as provided in this section. The means of
shall provide a continuous and unobstructed path of eégitd horizontal egress travel from all

of egress . ) : ; : . .
g portions of thelwellingto the exterior of thewellingat the require@xterior egress door without
requiring travel through a garage.
Exception: Equipment service platforms may be served by ladders constructed per R310.2.1.
R311.2 At least oneexterior egress door shall be provided for edefellingunit. The egress door shall be sid

Egress door

hinged, and shall provide a minimum clear width of 32 inches (813mm) when measured betweer
face of the door and ¢hstop, with the door open 90 degrees (1.57 rad). The minimum clear height
door opening shall not be less than 78 inches (1981 mm) in height measured from the top of the
threshold to the bottom of the stop. Otbgterior doors shall not be requiréd comply with these

minimum dimensionsAll interior and exterior egress doors shall be readily openable from the side
from which egress is to be madwithout the use of a key or special knowledge or effort.

R311.3.1
Floor
elevations at

Landings or floors at the required egress door shall not be more than 11/2 inches (38 mm) lower
top of the threshold.
Exception: The exterior landing or floor shall not be more tRal/4 (210 mmelow the top of the




the required
egress doors

threshold providethe door does not swing over the landing or floor. When exterior landings or flo
serving the required egress door are ngtratle they shall be provided with accesgtadeby means
of a ramp in accordance with Section R311.8 or a stairway in acmardath Section R311.7.

R311.3.2
Floor
elevations for
other exterior
doors

R311.3.2 Floor elevations for other exterior doorsDoors other than the required egress door shall
provided with landings or floors not more th&d/4 (210 mmpelow the topof the threshold.
Exception: A landing is not required where a stairwefytwo-orfewerrisersis located on the exterior
side of the door, provided the door does not swing over the stairway.

R311.5 Delete
Construction
R311.5.1 Delete
Attachment
The minimum width of a hallway shall be not less than 3 feet (914 mm) measured from the finish
R311.6.1
surface of the walls.
Hallways
R311.6.2 All doors providing egress from habitable rooms shall have nominal minimum dimensions of 2 feet 6

Interior doors

inches (762 mm) width by 6 feet 8 inches (2032 mm) height.

R311.7.3

Delete

R311.7.4.1
Riser height

The maximum riser height shall be 8 1/4 inches (210 mm). The riser shall be measured vertically
between leading edges of the adjacent treads. Theegreger height within any flight of stairs shall 1
exceed the smallest by more than 3/8 inch (9.5mm). The top and bottom riser of interior stairs sh
exceed the smallest riser within that stair run by more than 3/4 inch (19 mm). The heighbpfahe

bottom riser of the interior stairs shall be measured from the permanent finished surface (carpet
excluded). Where the bottom riser of an exterior stair adjoins an exterior walk, porch, driveway,
garage floor, or finish grade, the heightlé riser may be less than the height of the adjacent risers

R311.7.4.2
Tread depth

The minimum tread depth shall be 9 inches (229 mm). The tread depth shall be measured horizg
between the vertical planes of the foremost projection of adjacadstesd at a right angle to the
treadds | eading edge. The greatest tread de
more than 3/8 inch (9.5 mm). Winder treads shall have a minimum tread depth of 9 inches (229 i
measured as aboveapoint 12 inches (305) mm from the side where the treads are narrower. Wi
treads shall have a minimum tread depth of 4 inches (102 mm) at any point. Within any flight of g
the greatest winder tread depth at the 12 inch (305 mm) walk linenshatkceed the smallest by mor
than 3/8 inch (9.5 mm).

R311.7.6

Stairway The walking surface of treads and landings of stairways shall be sloped no steeper than one it inch
walking vertical in 48 inches horizontal (2-percent slope).

surface

R311.7.7.2 Handrails for stairways shall be continuous for the full length of the flight, from a point directly above
Continuity the top riser of the flight to a point directly above lowest riser of the flight. Handrail ends shall be

returned or shall terminate in newel posts or safety terminals. Handrails adjacent to a wall shall have a
space of not less than 1 1/2 inch (38 mm) between the wall and the handrails.
Exceptions:

1. Handrails shall be permitted to be interrupted by a newel post. atthe-turn-

2. The use of a volute, turnout, starting easing or starting newel shall be allowed over the
lowest tread.

3. Two or more separate rails shall be considered continuous if the termination of the
rails occurs within 6 inches (152 mm) of each other. If transitioning between a wall-




mounted handrail and a quardrail/handrail, the wall-mounted rail must return into the
wall.

All required handrails shall be of one of the following types or provide equivalent

R311.7.7.3 .
Grip-size graspability: S . : .
1. Type I. Handrails witla circular cross section shall have an outside diameter of at least ]
incheq32 mm) and not greater than 2 inches (51 mm). If the handrail is not circular, it sha
a perimetedimension of at least 4 inches (102 mm) and not greater thann@h&si (160 mm)
with a maximum cross section of dimension of 2 1/4 inches (57 mm). Edges shall have a
minimum radius of 0.01 inch (0.25 mm).
2. Type Il. Handrails with a perimeter greater than 6 1/4 inches (160 mm) shall have a gra
fingerrecess aa on both sides of the profile. The finger recess shall begin within a distan
3/4 inch (19mm) measured vertically from the tallest portion of the profile and achieve a d
of
at least 5/1@nch (8 mm) within 7/8 inch (22 mm) below the widest ortof the profile. This
required deptishall continue for at least 3/8 inch (10 mm) to a level that is not less than 13
inches (45 mm) below thallest portion of the profile. The minimum width of the handrall
above
the recess shall be 11/4 incl{8& mm) to a maximum of 23/4 inches (70 mm). Edges shall
a minimum radius of 0.01 indi®.25 mm).
Exception: Exterior handrails (garages and areas exposed to the weather) shall not be ma
31/2 inches (89 mm) in crosection dimension.
R311.7.9 Spira}l stairwaysand pulkhead enclosure stairqumd bowed tread stairwayhall comply with all
Special requirements of section R311.7 except as specified below.
stairways
R311.7.9.3 Bowed tread stairways.are permitted prodidieey are uniform in bowed trgad depth a]onq entire w
Bowed tread of_ tread with hot more t ha_ln 3_/ 80_ variance
stairways point shall the tread be less than a minimum of 9 inches with a nosing as listed in s8tfioh42 ang
R311.7.4.3 respectfully.
R311.7.9.3.1 The pottom 3 treads in. a standard st_raiqht run stairvyav application as listed under section R311
Standard permitted to bow provided at no point along the_W|dt_h of the tt_ec’mle y are 1|e S s
stairway under section R31.1.7.4.2 and each bowed tread is uniformed with other bowed treads with no n
application 3/ 806 variance from greatest to | east. Nosi n
R311.7.9.3.2 R311.7.9_.3.2 Bowed tread circular stairway_sBowed treads in a circular stairvv_ay are_permit
Bowed tread pr OVI.ded they are uni f or mled as per wi nqler t
circular from the side W_here the treads are narrqweerthls walk line bowed treads_ must be uniformed
stairways ot her circular stairway treads with the gqgr
Nosing is required as listed in section R311.7.4.
R313.1 An automatic residential fire sprinkler system shall be installed in townhouse buildings with 3 or more
Townhouse attached dwellings.
Automatic fire Exception: An automatic residential fire sprinkler system shall not be required when additions or
sprinkler alterations are made to existing townhouses that do not have an automatic residential fire
systems sprinkler
system installed.
R313.2 One |Delete
and two
family
dwellings

automatic fire




systems

R313.2.1 Delete
Design and
installation
R314.3.1 When alterations, repairs and additions requiring a building permit occur, or when one
Alteréti'ons or more sleeping rooms are added or created in existing dwellings, the individual dwelling
repairs and’ unit shall be equipped with smoke alarms lo cated as required for new dwellings; the
additions smoke alarms shall be interconnected and hard wired.
R314.4 Power | R314.4 Power source (same as IRC2009)
r ,
source Exceptions:
1. (no change)
2. Interconnection and hard  -wiring of smoke alarms in existing areas shal | not be
required where the alterations or repairs do not result in the removal of interior wall or
celllng flnlshes exposmg the structure, unless—the#e—ls—an—am&,era\AA—spaee—epbasemen{—
Femevalre#mtenepnnﬁhes— Smoke alarm Iocatlons are reqwred per Sectlon R314 2, but
may be battery powered and shall be designed to emit a recurring signal when batteries
are low and need to be replaced.
R315.1 In new construction, dwelling units shall be provided with an approved carbon monoxide
Carbc.)n alarm installed outside of each separate sleeping area in the immediate vicinity of the
monoxide bedroom(s).
alarms
R315.2 Where In existing dwe llings, where interior alterations, repairs, fuel -fired appliance
requi.red in replacements of additions work requiring a permit occurs, or where one or more sleeping
existing rooms are added or created, carbon monoxide alarms shall be provided in accordance
dwellings with Section 315.1.
R315.3 Alarm | The required carbon monoxide alarms shall be clearly audible in all bedrooms over background

requirements

noise levels with all intervening doors closed. Single station carbon monoxide alarms shall be listed
as complying with UL 2034 and shall be installed in accordance with this code and the

A

manufacturerds installation instructions.
R316.7 The use of f oam pModeste-Heawo i the ramietaes oM f dist at i on
Termite accordance with Section R318.4.
damage
R317.1 Protection of wood and wood based products from decay shall be provided in the following locations by
Location the use of naturally durable wood or wood that is preservative-treated in accordance with AWPA U1 for
required the species, product, preservative and end use. Preservatives shall be listed in Section 4 of AWPA U1l

1. Wood joists or the bottom of a wood structural floor when closer than 18 inches (457 mm) or
wood girders when closer than 12 inches (305 mm) to the exposed ground in crawl spaces or
unexcavated area located within the periphery of the building foundation.

2. All woed-framing-members exterior sills and plates that rest on concrete or masonry exterior
foundation walls ahd-areless-than-8-inches{203-mm)from-the-exposed-ground.

3. Sills and sleepers on a concrete or masonry slab, unless the slab that is in direct contact with the

ground is separated from the ground uhless-separatedfrom-such-stab by an approved

impervious moisture barrier.

4. The ends of wood girders entering exterior masonry or concrete walls having clearances of less
than 0.5 inch (12.7 mm) on tops, sides and ends.

5. Wood siding and sheathing and-walHraming on the exterior of a building having a clearance of




less than 6 inches (152 mm) from the ground.

6. Wood structural members supporting moisture-permeable floors or roofs that are exposed to the
weather, such as concrete or masonry slabs, unless separated from such floors or roofs by an
impervious moisture barrier.

7. Wood furring strips or other wood framing members attached directly to the interior of exterior
masonry walls or concrete walls below grade except where an approved vapor retarder is
applied between the wall and the furring strips or framing members.

8. All portions of a porch, screen porch or deck from the bottom of the header down, including
posts, quardrails, pickets, steps, and floor structure. Coverings that would prevent moisture or
water accumulation on the surface or at joints between members are allowed.

Exception:_Columns complying with R317.1.1, Exception #2

R317.1.1 Field = 6S—hO ardtilled
treatment accordance-with-AWPRA-M4Deleted.
R317.1.3 Delete

Geographical
areas

Wood columns. Wood columns shall bapprovedwood of natural decay resistanceapiproved

R317.1.4 )
pressurepreservativereated wood.

Wood Exceptions:

Columns 1. Columnsexpesed-te-the-weather iorbasementsshen supported bgonerete-piers-or-metal-pedestals
projecting-1-inch{25-4-m)-abovea concrete flooer-6-inches {152 mm)-above-exposed-earth
and-the-earth-is-covered lwith anapprovedmpervious moisture barriénstalled between the slab and earth
2. Columns exposed to the weather when all of the following conditionseire m

a. The column is supported by piers or metal pedestals projecting 1 inch (25.4 mm) above a concrete fl
inches (152mm) above exposed earth and the earth is covered by an approved impervious moisture
and
b. There is no ja@its in or between structural members (from the header to the base of the column); and
c. The column is protected from exposure to surface moisture at the top by a roof, eave, or overhang; &
d. The exterior surface of the column is fully sealedr(p sealer, etc..) against moisture intrusion.
3. Columns in enclosed crawl spaces or unexcavated areas located within the periphery of the building
when supported by a concrete pier or metal pedestal at a height more than 8 inches (203mm) from
exposed arth and the earth is covered by an impervious moisture barrier.

R318.1 Deleteitem #5 only

Protection

against sub-

terranean

termites

R318.1.2 Field | Delete

Treatment

R318.2 The concentration, rate of application and treatment method of the termiticide shall be consistent with

Chemical soil | and never less than the termiticide label and applied according to the standards of the North Carolina

treatment Department of Agriculture.

R318.3 Delete

Barriers

R318.4 Foam This section shlhpply to both treated and untreated foam plastic

plastic

protection

R318.4.1

All foam plastic shall be a minimum of 8 inche®32nm) above grade See Appendix O




Foundation Exception: Foam plastic less than 8 inché3(&m) above or in contact with grade shalirstalled in
walls accordance with Section 318.5.5 and Appendix O

R318.4.2 When foam plastic is in contagith the ground subterranean termite control shall be in

Termite accordance with Section 318.1

control

R318.4.3 Slab Foam péstic ‘s‘hall_be inst.alled along the vertical edge and underneath the

on grade slab as specified in Section R318.5.5

(non-

structural)

R318.4.4 slab All slabs which distribute the wall loads to the foundation shall be insulated as specified in this s€
on grade Foan plastic shall be installed along the vertical edge and underneath grade as specified in Appe

(structural)

Figure 03

Foam plastic in contact with ground.

R318.4.5

Foam plastién contact with the ground shall not bentinuous to théottom of the weatheaesistant
R318.4.5.1 = , = ; . =
Inspection siding A clear and unobstructétdinch (51 mm) minimum inspection gap shHadl maintained from the

and treatment
gaps

bottom of the weatheesistansiding to the top of any foam plast& minimum 4inch (102 mm)
treatmengap shall be provided beginning mobre than 6 inches (152 mm) below grablee top and
bottom edges of the foam plastic installed betweeimgpection gap and the treatment gap shall be
at a45-degree (9 rad) angleSee Appendix 0

Exception: Fo ICF foundations see Secti®#04.4.7.2

R318.4.5.2
Protection of
exposed foam
plastic

Exposedoam plastic shall be protected from physical dam&be required inspection gap foam plas
and treatmengap shall be on the exterior with a cementitiooatingthat extends at least 2 inches (51
mm) below the foamplastic onto the surface of the foundation wa#eAppendix 0

R318.4.5.3
Waterproofing
foam plastic
between
inspection
gap and
treatment gap

Waterproofing shalbe installed over the requdeementitious coating frofinches (152 mm) above
grade to the treatment gap peanufacturer's installation instructions.

R318.4.5.4
Dampproofing
of below
grade walls

Any foam plastic applied below the treatment gap shaith&talled after requed foundation wall
dampproofing isn place. See section R406 and Appendix O.

R321.1
Elevators

Where provided elevats shall comply with ASME A17.1

R321.2
Platform lifts

Where provided, platformfts shall comply with ASME A18.1

R321.3
Accessibility

Deleted

R321.4

The installer shall certify that the following conditions have been met.




Certification

1. The el evator or platform |Iift has been i
instructions.

2. The elevator meets thegrerements of ASME A17.1, Part 5, Section 5.3 and other applicable pa
3. The elevator or platform lift meets the requirements oNbegh Carolina Electrical CodeBefore a
Certificate of Occupancy is issued, the permit holder shall provide the ofeament official a letter
of certification from the installer, evidencing compliance with the above conditions. Any mainteng
requirements required by the manufacturer shall be stated and affixed to the component. When ¢
elevator or platform lift oits componentfas been serviced, the service provider shall certify to the
owner that the elevator continues to meet the above conditions.

R322.1 Buildings and structures constructedwhole or in part in flood hazard areas (including A or \h&%)

General as established in Table R301.2(1) shall be designed arstirected in accordance with the provisig
contained in this sectio@ee additional provisions of Chapter 46.

R322.2.1 Elevation requirements.

Elevation 1. Buildings and struares shall have the lowest floaevated to or above timase flood elevation plu

requirements

one foot (305mm)or thedesign flood elevatigrwhichever is higher
2. In areas of shallow flooding (AO Zones), buildirmgsl structures shall have the lowest floor
(includingbasement) elevated at least as high above the higgljesent grade as the depth number
specified in feefmm) on the FIRMplus one foot (305mmpr at leasB feet @15mm)if a depth
number is not specified.
3. Basement floors that are belowdgaon all sides shable elevated to or above thase flood
elevation plus one foot (305mpor thedesign flood elevatianwhichever is higher
Exception: Enclosed areas below the design flood elevainmhiding basements whose floors ¢
not belowgrade on all sides, shall meet the requirements of SeR8aA2.2.

R322.3.1 Delete

Chapter 4 Foundations
R401.4.1 u of a complete geotechnical evaluation, the load-bearing values in Table | 4.
Geotechnical | assumed—The load bearing values greater than 2000 psf in Table R401.4.1 require an
evaluation engineering evaluation.
Table R401 TABLE R401.4.1

PRESUMPTIVE LOAD-BEARING VALUES OF FOUNDATIONS MATERIALS?2

Class of Material Load-Bearing Pressure (pounds per square
foot)
Crystalline bedrock 12,000
Sedimentary and foliated rock 6,000
Sandy gravel and/or gravel (GW and GP) 5,000
Sand, silty sand, clayey sand, silty gravel and 3,000
clayey gravel (SW, SP, SM, SC, GM and GC)
Clay, sandy clay, silty clay, clayey silt, silt and 2,000°
sandy silt (CL, ML, MH and CH)

For SI: 1 pound per square foot = 0.0479 kN/m?2.

a. When soil tests are required by Section R401.4, the allowable bearing capacities of the soil shall be
part of the recommendations.

b. Where the building official determines that ind place soils with an allowable bearing capacity of less
than 45060 2000 psf are likely to be present at the site, the allowable bearing capacity shall be
determined by a soils investigation.




TABLE R403.1

Table R403.1 MINIMUM WIDTH OF CONCRETE OR
MASONRY FOOTINGS
(inches)a
LOAD-BEARING VALUE OF SOIL (psf)
1,500 ‘ 2,000 ‘ 3,000 4,000
Conventional lighti frame construction
1-story 16° 16° 12 12
2-story 16° 16° 12 12
3-story 23 17 12 12
4-inch brick veneer over light frame or 8-inch hollow concrete masonry
1-story 16° 16° 12 12
2-story 21 16 12 12
3-story 32 24 16 12
8-inch solid or fully grouted masonry
1-story 16 16° 12 12
2-story 29 21 14 12
3-story 42 32 21 16

For SI: 1 inch = 25.4 mm, 1 pound per square foot = 0.0479 kPa.
a. Where minimum footing width is 12 inches, use of a single wythe of sdiidlypr
grouted 12nch nominal concrete masonry units is permitted.
b. A minimum footingvidth of 12" is acceptable for monolithic slab foundations.

Insert table from NC 2009 code

Table 403.1a
Pier and
footing sizes
for support
girders

R403.1.2 Delete
R403.1.3

R403.1.3.1
R403.1.3.2
R403.1.4.2




